
COMMISSION STUDY SESSION 
February 19, 2007 - 6:15 p.m. 

Commission Chambers 
 

 
Discussion of Ordinance restricting concealed carry of firearms. 

If a reasonable accommodation is necessary to participate in a City of Dodge City event or service please contact us 
at 225-8100, 225-8155 TDD or by contacting the Kansas Relay Center at 1-800-766-3777. 



COMMISSION AGENDA 
February 19, 2007 - 7:00 p.m. 

Commission Chambers 
MEETING NO. 4668 

 
 
CALL TO ORDER 
  
ROLL CALL 
 
INVOCATION by Dr. Jerry Ketner, New Hope on the Plains 
 
PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 
 
PETITIONS & PROCLAMATIONS 
 
  
 
VISITORS (Limit of 5 minutes per individual and fifteen minutes per topic.  Final action may be 
deferred until the next City Commission meeting, unless an emergency situation does exist) 
 
 
CONSENT CALENDAR 
 
1. Approval of Minutes of Regular Meeting of February 5, 2007 
   
2. Approval of payment of bills. 
 
3.  Approval of joint mortgage resolution on Kimbroy loan. 
 
ORDINANCES & RESOLUTIONS  
 
UNFINISHED BUSINESS 
 
NEW BUSINESS  

 
1. Approval of bids for Utility Water Supplies.  Report by Director of Administration, Mike 

Klein. 
 

2. Approval of contract for professional engineering services for Runways 14-32 and 2-20 
survey seal and Runway 2-20 lighting rehabilitation.  Report by Director of 
Administration, Mike Klein. 

 
3. Approval of distribution of 2006 alcohol and drug surtax funds.  Report by Director of 

Special Projects, Ryan Carpenter. 
 
4. Approval of design enhancement of Fourteenth Street.  Report by Public Works Director, 

Joe Finely. 
 

If a reasonable accommodation is necessary to participate in a City of Dodge City event or service please contact us 
at 225-8100, 225-8155 TDD or by contacting the Kansas Relay Center at 1-800-766-3777. 



5. Approval of Flying J Development Agreement.  Report by City Attorney, Ken Strobel. 
 
6. Approval of Interlocal agreement for firing range between the City and County.  Report by 

City Attorney, Ken Strobel. 
 

OTHER BUSINESS 
 
City Manager 
Commissioners 
 
 

ADJOURNMENT 

If a reasonable accommodation is necessary to participate in a City of Dodge City event or service please contact us 
at 225-8100, 225-8155 TDD or by contacting the Kansas Relay Center at 1-800-766-3777. 



MINUTES 
February 5, 2007 - 7:00 p.m. 

MEETING NO. 4668 
 
 

MAYOR Jim Sherer called the regular meeting to order at 7:00 p.m. 
 
RESPONDING TO ROLL CALL were Mayor Sherer, Commissioners Jim Lembright, Rick 
Sowers, Kent Smoll and Terry Lee.  
 
The Invocation was given by Vernon Bogart, Ft. Dodge Chapel 
 
Boy Scout Troop 168 presented the colors and led the PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE. 
 
PETITIONS & PROCLAMATIONS 
 

Mayor Sherer read a proclamation naming February as National AMBUCS Month.  
Merle Kaufman was in attendance representing Ambucs. 

 
 Mayor Sherer read a proclamation naming February 4-10, 2007 as Scouting Anniversary 
Week 
 
VISITORS (Limit of 5 minutes per individual and fifteen minutes per topic.  Final action may be 
deferred until the next City Commission meeting, unless an emergency situation does exist) 
 
David Shaw discussed the proposed smoking ban.  He talked about the businesses making the 
choice for several years and many places are ‘no smoking’ establishments.  He stated he feels it’s 
a rights issue. 
 
Representatives Rose Ward and Martha Mendoza announced the 2007 class of the Hispanic 
Leadership Dodge Program who were in attendance. 
 
Ryan Carpenter, Director of Special Projects, reported that a bill has been introduced by the State 
Senate for a statewide smoking ban. 
 
Vernon Bogart asked about the cost of infrastructure for the Events Center. 
 
Gary Cline commented about the concealed carry law and stated he had taken a course to qualify 
for a concealed carry permit. 
 
David Lineer spoke on concealed carry ordinance. 
 
Mike Weber spoke on concealed carry ordinance. 
 
Lowell Brakey spoke on concealed carry ordinance. 
 
Rick Salem said he’d heard one of the finalists for the DCRP promoter had pulled out and he 
wanted to let the City know he is still interested. 



 
The Character Trait for February – flexibility – was read by Tanner Rumbaugh. 
 
The CONSENT CALENDAR was approved on a motion by Commissioner Lembright, seconded 
by Commissioner Sowers, by unanimous vote. 
 
1. Approval of Minutes of Regular Meeting of January 16, 2007 
   
2. Approval of payment of bills. 
 
3.  Approval of cereal malt beverage license for: 
 A.  Boothill Phillips 66, 800 W. Wyatt Earp Blvd. 
 B.  JT Conoco 609 S. Second Avenue 
 C.  Gene’s Heartland Foods, 1800 Central 
 (pending inspections by Fire & Inspections Depts.) 
 
4.  Approval of Change Order #1 for the Civic Center Parking Lot Reconstruction Project. 
 
ORDINANCES & RESOLUTIONS  
 
Ordinance No. 3429: An Ordinance establishing prohibitions against the possession or carrying 

of certain firearms while upon designated property owned and/or operated 
by the City of Dodge City, Kansas was tabled to be discussed at a work 
session at the next meeting on a motion by Commissioner Smoll, seconded 
by Commissioner Sowers, by unanimous vote. 

 
Kerry Zimmerman spoke on the topic. 
 
UNFINISHED BUSINESS 
 
NEW BUSINESS  

 
1. The following were appointed to vacancies on various listed boards and commissions on a 

motion by Commissioner Sowers, seconded by Commissioner Smoll, by unanimous vote. 
 
HOUSING AUTHORITY BOARD  
 Leland Kincaid  
 Celia Enriquez 
LIBRARY BOARD  
 Beulah Jones 
 Juan L. Ferreiro 
AIRPORT ADVISORY BOARD  
 Richard Goodnough 
 Kerry Zimmerman 
 Dan Cammack 
RECYCLING ADVISORY BOARD 
 Julie Melia 
 Ron Hamm 
 Hope Tallent 
DODGE CITY ZONING BOARD 
 Michael Bosley 



 Billy Manning 
 Hans Katzenmeier 
BOARD OF ZONING APPEALS 
 Robert Vinton 
 Benjamin Sherber 
HISTORIC LANDMARK COMMISSION 
 Janice Klein 
 Kathie Bell 
CONVENTION & VISITORS BUREAU 
(at large) Sonya Hughes 
 Beth Rhoten 
(Attraction)  
 Robert Lancaster 
(Hospitality)  
 Kim Cunningham 
 Nageeb Alhaj 
SHADE TREE COMMISSION 
 Nina Kliewer 

Gary Musick 
 Michael Schubert 
PARKS & RECREATION ADVISORY BOARD 
 Dave Geist 
 Barbara Lundin 
 Travis Harrod 
GOLF ADVISORY BOARD  
 Steve Doll 
ST. MARY OF THE PLAINS COLLEGE ADVISORY COMMITTEE  
 Cody Keith 
 Kent Stehlick 
 Dave Geist 
 Don Pendergast 
 Pat McLaughlin 

 
2. A proposal for Compensation and Classification Plan from McGrath Consulting in the 

amount of $34,308 was approved on a motion by Commissioner Smoll, seconded by 
Commissioner Lembright, by unanimous vote.   

 
3. Commissioner Lembright moved to approve the Flying J Development Agreement.  The 

motion was seconded by Commissioner Sowers.  After further discussion, Commissioner 
Lembright rescinded his motion, Commissioner Sowers rescinded his second.  
Commissioner Sowers moved to table the agreement, Commissioner Smoll seconded the 
motion.  Motion carried unanimously. 

 
4. Mayor Sherer updated the Commission on the Friendship Charter relationship with 

Stockport, England. 
 

OTHER BUSINESS 
 
Commissioner Sherer reported he has been reappointed to the Human Development Steering 

Committee for the National League of Cities.  He also commented about the Open House 
for the Habitat for Humanity house. 

 
Commissioner Sowers stated there will be a Mardi Gras Night at the Cathedral on February 20th 

as a fund raiser for the next Habitat house. 



 
Commissioner Lee said he had attended an awards ceremony at the Police Department. 
 
City Manager, Jeff Pederson, reminded everyone that the Public Library will celebrate their 100th 
year Anniversary on Sunday from 2:00 – 4:00. 
 
 
Commissioner Lembright, moved to adjourn to EXECUTIVE SESSION at 8:45 p.m. for 1 hour.  

The motion was seconded by Commissioner Lee and carried unanimously.  Those 
remaining in the session were the five Commissioners and City Manager, Jeff Pederson. 

 
At 9:45, a motion was made by Commissioner Smoll to extend the Executive Session by 30 

minutes.  The motion was seconded by Commissioner Sowers and passed unanimously. 
 
The meeting resumed to regular session at 10:15 p.m.  Commissioner Smoll moved to amend the 

City Manager’s employment contract to:  increase the deferred compensation 
contribution to 8% of base salary and to set the City Manager’s contract at $97,344.  It 
was further moved to establish 2007 performance based pay of up to $7,000 based upon 
the City Commissions performance evaluation.  The motion was seconded by 
Commissioner Lee and passed unanimously. 

 
Commissioner Lee moved to adjourn the meeting at 10:18 p.m.  Commissioner Sowers seconded 

the motion which passed unanimously. 
 
 

______________________________ 
Jim Sherer, Mayor 

Attest: 
 
 
_______________________________ 
Nannette Pogue, City Clerk 















City of Dodge City 
City of Dodge City 
806 2nd Ave. 
 67801 

Phone:  620-225-8100 
FAX:  620-225-8144 
dodgecity.org  

        Memorandum 
 
To:  Jeff Pederson, City Manager 
 City Commission 
From: Mike Klein, Director of Administration 
Date: February 7, 2007 
Subject: 2007 Utility Water Supply bids 
 2007 Budget Fund and Amount 
 Utility Fund:  510-4100-441-30-04  $290,000.00 

 
Six bids were received and opened on February 6, 2007 at 2:00 p.m. for utility water supplies.  
The bid package consists of copper, HDPE tubing, meters, radio read heads, brass items, 
inserters, brass saddles, meter jars and lids, repair clamps, couplings, gate valves, pipe and other 
items.  Supplies will be utilized to maintain and upgrade the City’s water system.   
 
Bid tabulation is attached for your review.  Based on the bids received, Staff would recommend 
the following: 
 
Municipal Supply, Inc., Hastings, NE 
 
Meters    $   92,530.45 
Radio Read Heads  $   41,608.95
  TOTAL   $134,139.40 
 
Water Products, Inc., McPherson, KS 
 
Copper    $    6,990.00 
HDPE Tubing   $       785.00 
Brass items   $    5,996.10 
Couplings   $    2,639.40 
Gate valves   $    4,033.88 
Pipe    $       348.00 
Other items    $     2,462.50
  TOTAL   $23,254.88 
 
Wichita Winwater, Wichita, KS 
 
Inserters/Stiffeners  $        149.00 
  TOTAL   $       149.00 
 
DC Wholesale, Concordia, KS 
 
Meter Jars & Lids  $      6,404.00 
  TOTAL   $    6,404.00 
 
 



 
 
D.C. & B. Supply, Pratt, KS 
 
Brass Saddles   $         543.00 
Repair Clamps   $      2,571.02
  TOTAL   $ 3,114.02 
 
HD Supply Waterworks, Olathe, KS 
(No low bid items) 
 
  Total Expenditure    $ 167,061.30 
 
 
If you have any questions or need additional information, please contact my office. 
 
cc: Joe Finley, Public Works Director 
 Ken Zielke, Utility Superintendent 



RADIO READ INSERTERS BRASS METER JARS FULL CIRCLE MJ RES. OTHER

COMPANY COPPER HDPE TUBING METERS HEADS BRASS ITEMS STIFFENERS SADDLES & LIDS REP. CLAMPS COUPLINGS GATE VALVES PIPE ITEMS TOTAL

HD Supply Waterworks, Olathe, KS $11,070.00 $980.00 NO BID NO BID $6,087.22 $152.00 $738.00 $12,133.00 $3,406.56 $2,679.78 $5,189.20 $390.00 $3,028.00

Municipal Supply, Inc., Hastings, NE $7,350.00 $820.00 $92,530.45 $41,608.95 $7,249.12 $159.00 $768.00 $3,702.78 $4,466.16 $4,936.44 $358.80 $2,545.50 $134,139.40

Water Products, Inc., McPherson, KS $6,990.00 $785.00 NO BID NO BID $5,996.10 $150.00 $726.80 $7,572.80 $2,973.56 $2,639.40 $4,033.88 $348.00 $2,462.50 $23,254.88

Wichita Winwater, Wichita, KS NO BID $870.00 NO BID NO BID $6,008.10 $149.00 $722.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $438.00 NO BID $149.00

DC Wholesale, Concordia, KS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $6,404.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $6,404.00

D.C. & B Supply, Inc., Pratt, KS NO BID $850.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $160.00 $543.00 NO BID $2,571.02 $2,988.12 NO BID $400.80 NO BID $3,114.02

TOTAL EXPENDITURE $167,061.30
LOW BID

























 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

City of Dodge City
 

 

 

PO Box 880 
806 North Second Avenue 
Dodge City, Kansas 67801 

 

 

Phone  620.225.8100 
FAX  620.225.8144 
www.dodgecity.org 

        
     Memorandum 

To: Jeff Pederson 
cc: City Commission 
From: Ryan Carpenter, Director of Special Project/ 
 Assistant to the City Manager 
Date: February 7, 2007 
Subject: 2006 Distribution of Alcohol & Drug Surtax Funds 

 
Pursuant to KSA 79-41a04, a portion of the Alcohol and Drug Surtax Funds received by the City for 
year 2007 are recommended to be distributed as follows. The City received six applications totaling 
$191,810.55 in requests while $100,000.00 is available for distribution. Once the grant proposals 
were submitted a Special Alcohol & Drug Tax Distribution Review Team was assembled with the 
specific task of making a recommendation for distribution of the requests that were submitted 
through a rubric review system. 
 
Three Dodge City residents with varying backgrounds in finance, grant writing, administration, 
community and non-profit boards, understanding of quality of life issues, and the willingness to 
donate a few hours to assist in the review and recommendation process were asked to serve.  
 
The Review Team met February 7, 2007 to review and discuss their recommendations for the grant 
requests. All of the requests met the guidelines outlined by the State Statue and the Citizens Review 
Team felt all programs are very valuable and needed in the community. The Review Team does have 
suggestions for the organizations that submitted requests for funds to better outline their requests in 
the future. 
 
United Methodist Church Group, Joy! Child Development Center - 
Project ‘Operation “I Can and I Will!”’ – $7,666.67 recommended funding; there was concern by 
the Review Team that only 20 individuals between the ages of 6 - 12 who could potentially remain in 
the program for 6 years are being served by this project. Ultimately, if more youth could be served by 
the program this would provide for more youth to develop to their full potential.  
 
Ford County - 
Project ‘Alternative School/Community Education Opportunities’ - $19,794.00 recommended 
funding; Review Team feels that the program is very worthwhile, funding should provide more for 
students and their educational and program component in-house counseling as opposed to salary. Do 
to the amount of available funding the amount requested was reduced.  
 
NEW CHANCE, INC. - 
Project ‘New Chance, Inc.’ - $30,000.00 recommended funding; due to the total amount of funds 
requested the Review Team had to reduce the funds requested. The Review Team also felt that there  
 
 
 
 
 



 
 
 
 
 
were a number of worthy projects that submitted applications focusing on youth and they would 
prefer to provide funding to projects/programs that head off the potential abuse of alcohol and drugs 
by youth before the abuse grows into adulthood.  
 
Dodge City Public Library - 
Project ‘Alcohol and Drug Abuse Prevention Video/Book Library update’ - $1,518.28 recommended 
funding; Review Team is concerned that the information is available but how is it being ‘marketed’ 
to alert the public that the materials are available and what their value to individuals can be.  
 
City of Dodge City Police Department - 
Project ‘D.A.R.E.’ -$16,366.00 recommended funding; Review Team felt that to much funding is 
being used on propaganda for the program and would prefer to see more direct relation to the 
students, possibly using students to educate students. Review Team would recommend additional 
qualified speakers for the public and school district to take part in. Is there a way to bring the annual 
conferences to the students on a state level which would allow them to interact and take part more in 
depth, potentially.   
 
City of Dodge City Police Department -  
Project ‘J.U.D.G.E. Juvenile Underage Drinking Group Education/Enforcement’ - $24,655.05 
recommended funding; Review Team is very enthused by this program and really feels that it is 
meeting and performing a direct definition of the legislation. Sadly, due to the amount of funding 
available the amount requested had to be reduced.    
 
In the future organizations/agencies applying should strongly collaborate with other organizations to 
benefit and allow for greater access to distributed funds through resource materials, facilities, public 
served, public information available, etc. Through collaboration a larger effort can be made to 
eradicate drug and alcohol abuse and the need for such funding to exist.    
 
Recommendation by staff would be to approve the annual Drug & Alcohol Surtax Funds for 
distribution. If you have any questions do not hesitate to contact me.  
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