
CITY COMMISSION MEETING AGENDA 
City Hall Commission Chambers 

Monday, August 21, 2023 

 7:00 p.m. 

MEETING #5256 

 
Public is welcome although seats are limited for social distancing; or you can view as follows: 

1. Watch live on our Facebook page at www.facebook.com/cityofdodgecity 

2. Or watch it on our Vimeo page at www.vimeo.com/cityofdodgecity. 

The meeting will be archived on both sites to be viewed after the live video has ended. 

 

 
CALL TO ORDER 
 
ROLL CALL 
 
INVOCATION by   
 
PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCe 
 
APPROVAL OF AGENDA 
 
PETITIONS & PROCLAMATIONS 
 
VISITORS (Limit of five minutes per individual and fifteen minutes per topic.  Final 
action may be deferred until the next City Commission meeting unless an emergency 
situation does exist). 
 
CONSENT CALENDAR 

 
1. Approval of City Commission Work Session Minutes, August 7, 2023. 
2. Approval of City Commission Meeting Minutes, August 7, 2023. 
3. Appropriation Ordinance No.16, August 21, 2023. 
4. Cereal Malt Beverage License: 

a. Dillons Store, 1700 N. 14th Avenue 
5. Approval of Change Order #1 for Iron Road (14th Ave. to 6th Ave.) Improvements. 

 
ORDINANCES & RESOLUTIONS 
 
Ordinance No. 3803: An Ordinance Regulating Traffic within the Corporate Limits of the City 

of Dodge City, Kansas; Incorporating by Reference the “2023 Standard Traffic Ordinance for 

Kansas Cities” and Repealing Ordinance No. 3779.  Report by Nicole May, Finance Director.  

 

Ordinance No. 3804 An Ordinance Regulating Public Offenses within the Corporate Limits of 

the City of Dodge City, Kansas; Incorporating by Reference the “Uniform Public Offense Code 

for Kansas Cities, Edition 2023” and Repealing Ordinance No. 3780.  Report by Nicole May, 

City Finance Director. 

 

http://www.facebook.com/cityofdodgecity
http://www.vimeo.com/cityofdodgecity


UNFINISHED BUSINESS 
 

NEW BUSINESS 
 

1. Approval of the Agreement with Outlaw Productions to Operate/Promote the Dodge City 

Raceway Park for the 2024 Season. Report by Melissa McCoy, Assistant City 

Manager/Public Affairs. 

 

2. Approval of United Village Addition Plat. Report by Nathan Littrell, Planning and 

Zoning Administrator. 

 

3. Approval of Quotes for United Village Infrastructure Improvements Report by Ray 

Slattery, Director of Engineering. 

 

4. Approval of Bids for Legends Park Lot Repair. Report by Ray Slattery, Director of 

Engineering. 

 
OTHER BUSINESS 
 
Staff reports 
 
ADJOURNMENT 



CITY COMMISSION work session MINUTES 

City Hall Commission Chambers 

Monday, August 7, 2022 

6:00 p.m. 
 

Public is welcome although seats are limited for social distancing; or you can view as 

follows: 

1. Watch live on our Facebook page at www.facebook.com/cityofdodgecity 

2. Or watch it on our Vimeo page at www.vimeo.com/cityofdodgecity. 

The meeting will be archived on both sites to be viewed after the live video has ended. 

 

 

 
CALL TO ORDER 

 
ROLL CALL: Mayor Michael Burns, Commissioners, Rick Sowers, Chuck Taylor, 
Kent Smoll, Joseph Nuci joined at 6:05.  
 

WORK SESSION 

 
2024 Budget was presented by Finance Director, Nicole May along with discussion of the 

same.  
 

 ADJOURNMENT 

Commissioner Joseph Nuci moved to adjourn the meeting. Commissioner Kent Smoll 
seconded the motion. The motion carried unanimously. 

 

 

_____________________ 

ATTEST:                                                                                Mayor 

                      

              

                                    

________________________ 

City Clerk 

 
 
 

http://www.facebook.com/cityofdodgecity
http://www.vimeo.com/cityofdodgecity


CITY COMMISSION MEETING MINUTES 
City Hall Commission Chambers 

Monday, August 7, 2023 

 7:00 p.m. 

MEETING #5254 

 
Public is welcome although seats are limited for social distancing; or you can view as follows: 

1. Watch live on our Facebook page at www.facebook.com/cityofdodgecity 

2. Or watch it on our Vimeo page at www.vimeo.com/cityofdodgecity. 

The meeting will be archived on both sites to be viewed after the live video has ended. 

 

 
CALL TO ORDER 

 
ROLL CALL: Mayor Michael Burns, Commissioners Joseph Nuci, Rick Sowers, Chuck Taylor, 
Kent Smoll 
 

INVOCATION by Minister Dusty Cookson of First Church of Christ 
 
PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 

 

APPROVAL OF AGENDA 

 

Mayor Michael Burns moved to amend the agenda and add two Cereal Malt Beverage License 
applications, Speed-D-Stop and Riverstop Stores and following staff reports add an executive 
session.  
 

Commissioner Kent Smoll moved to approve the agenda as amended. Commissioner Joseph 
Nuci seconded the motion. The motion carried unanimously.                     
 

PETITIONS & PROCLAMATIONS 

 
Mayor Michel Burns read the 811 Day Proclamation and proclaimed August 11, 2023 as 811 

Day in Dodge City, Kansas to encourage everyone to call 811 before they dig. It’s safe, it’s free, 

and it’s the law.  

 

Shawn Nelson, ambassador of Black Hills Energy for Dodge City thanked the commission for 

bringing forth the proclamation on 811 Day.Safety is important part in everything we do and 

thanked for helping recognize 811 day. 
 

VISITORS (Limit of five minutes per individual and fifteen minutes per topic.  Final action 
may be deferred until the next City Commission meeting unless an emergency situation 
does exist). 
 
CONSENT CALENDAR 

 
1. Approval of City Commission Meeting Minutes, July 17, 2023. 
2. Appropriation Ordinance No.15, August 7, 2023. 

 

http://www.facebook.com/cityofdodgecity
http://www.vimeo.com/cityofdodgecity
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3. Cereal Malt Beverage License: 
a. Love’ Country Store #58, 1508 W. Wyatt Earp Blvd. 
b. Kate’s, 305 E. Trail Street. 

 
Commissioner Chuck Taylor moved to accept the consent calendar as presented. Commissioner 
joseph Nuci seconded the motion. The motion carried unanimously.      
                                    
ORDINANCES & RESOLUTIONS 

 

Ordinance No. 3802: An Ordinance authorizing and providing for the issuance of 
General Obligation Bonds, Series 2023-A, of the City of Dodge City, Kansas; providing 
for the levy and collection of an annual tax for the purpose of paying the principal of and 
interest on said bonds as they become due; authorizing certain other documents and 
actions in connection therewith; and making certain covenants with respect thereto was 
approved on a motion by Commissioner Kent Smoll. Commissioner Chuck Taylor 
seconded the motion. The motion carried unanimously.                     

 
Resolution No.  2023-26: A Resolution prescribing the form and details of and 
authorizing and directing the sale and delivery of general obligation bonds, Series 2023-
A, of the City of Dodge City, Kansas, previously authorized by Ordinance No. 3802 of 
the issuer; making certain covenants and agreements to provide for the payment and 
security thereof; and authorizing certain other documents and actions connected therewith 
was approved on a motion by Commissioner Kent Smoll. Commissioner Joseph Nuci 
seconded the motion. The motion carried unanimously.                     

 
Resolution No.  2023-27: A Resolution authorizing and directing the issuance, sale and 
delivery of General Obligation Temporary Notes, Series 2023-1, of the City of Dodge 
City, Kansas; providing for the levy and collection of an annual tax, if necessary, for the 
purpose of paying the principal of and interest on said notes as they become due; making 
certain covenants and agreements to provide for the payment and security thereof; and 
authorizing certain other documents and actions connected therewith was approved on a 
motion by Commissioner Rick Sowers. Commissioner Chuck Taylor seconded the 
motion. The motion carried unanimously.                     

 
Resolution No.  2023-28: A Resolution making certain findings and determinations as to 
the need for housing within the City of Dodge City, Kansas and setting forth the legal 
description of real property proposed to be designated as a rural housing incentive district 
within the City was approved on a motion by Commissioner Chuck Taylor_. 
Commissioner Joseph Nuci seconded the motion. The motion carried unanimously.                     

 

Resolution No.  2023-29: A Resolution making certain findings and determinations as to 
the need for housing within the City of Dodge City, Kansas and setting forth the legal 
description of real property proposed to be designated as a rural housing incentive district 
within the City was approved on a motion by Commissioner Kent Smoll. Commissioner 
Rick Sowers seconded the motion. The motion carried unanimously.   
 

UNFINISHED BUSINESS 
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NEW BUSINESS 

 
1. Commissioner Rick Sowers moved to approve the implementation of the clear bag policy 

for the United Wireless Arena. Commissioner Kent Smoll seconded the motion. The 
motion carried 4 -1 with Commissioner Joseph Nuci voting no.                     
 

2. Commissioner-Mayor Michael Burns moved to approve to reimburse the VenuWorks 
budget subsidy request in the amount of $96,980. Commissioner Rick Sowers seconded 
the motion. The motion carried unanimously.                     
 

3. Commissioner Rick Sowers moved to approve the bid from American Implement in the 
amount of $122,500 for five (5) Hustler 105” Mowers ($24,500 for each) for three 
different divisions in the Parks Department. Commissioner Joseph Nuci seconded the 
motion. The motion carried unanimously.                     
 

4. Commissioner Kent Smoll moved to approve the bid from PBX Corporation in the amount 
of $378,690.47 for the 14th Avenue south bound bridge maintenance project. 
Commissioner Rick Sowers seconded the motion. The motion carried unanimously.                      

 
5. Commissioner Rick Sowers moved to approve the bid from Icon Structures of Wichita, 

KS in the amount of $8,055,044.85 for Dodge City Regional Airport terminal building 
expansion & remodel. Commissioner Chuck Taylor seconded the motion. The motion 
carried unanimously.                     

 
6. Commissioner Rick Sowers moved to approve amendment No. 1 to authorization No. 4 

with Burns and McDonnell in the amount not to exceed $180,895.53 for the Terminal 
Expansion and Remodel Design for the Dodge City Regional Airport.  Commissioner 
Joseph Nuci seconded the motion. The motion carried unanimously.                      

 
7. Commissioner Kent Smoll moved to approve authorization No. 8 service agreement with 

Burns and McDonnell in the amount not to exceed $890,255.07 for construction phase 
services for the terminal expansion and remodel of the Dodge City Regional Airport. 
Commissioner Rick Sowers seconded the motion. The motion carried unanimously.                     
 

8. Commissioner Chuck Taylor moved to approve authorize No. 6 with Burns and 
McDonnell in the amount not to exceed $686,492.02 to complete the preliminary design 
for construction of the Dodge City Regional Airport Runway 02/20. Commissioner Joseph 
Nuci seconded the motion. The motion carried unanimously.                     

 
OTHER BUSINESS 

 

STAFF REPORTS 
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EXECUTIVE SESSION 

 

At 8:23 pm Commissioner Rick Sowers made a motion that the Commission recess into 

executive session pursuant to the consult with legal counsel pursuant to the exception found in 

K.S.A. 75-4319(b)( 2 ), justification for closing the meeting is to protect confidentiality of the 

privileged matters to be discussed relating to pending or potential litigations against the city.  
The meeting will include the Commissioners, Attorney and City Manager. The open meeting 

will resume in the City Commission chamber in 20 minutes at 8:45 p.m.  The Commission may 

take action upon returning to open session and prior to adjournment. 

Commissioner Joseph Nuci seconded the motion.  The motion carried unanimously.       

               

The open meeting reconvened at 8:50 p.m. 
 

ADJOURNMENT 

 

Commissioner Rick Sowers moved to adjourn the meeting. Commissioner Joseph Nuci seconded 
the motion. The motion carried unanimously.                     
 
                   

 
_________________________ 

ATTEST:                                                                                Mayor 

                                                                        

 

 

_________________________ 

City Clerk 
 

 

 

 

 

 



 
To:  Nick Hernandez, City Manager and City Commissioners   
From:  Ray Slattery, PE, Director of Engineering Services   
Date:  August 21, 2023   
Subject:  Change Order #1, Iron Rd. (14th Ave. to 6th Ave. ) Improvements, ST 2108   
Agenda Item:  Consent Calendar 

 
Purpose: Finalize the quantities of the Iron Rd. Improvement Project from 14th Ave. to 6th Ave. 
 
Recommendation: Approve Change Order #1 for the Iron Rd. (14th Ave. to 6th Ave.) Improvement Project for an increase 
in the amount of $101.43. 
 
Background: At the April 4, 2022, Commission Meeting, the Commission awarded the construction of the Iron Rd. (14th 
Ave. to 6th Ave.) Improvements to Building Solutions. The project is complete.  This Change Order represents the field 
measured quantities of the project.      
 
City Commission Options: 

1. Approve  
2. Disapprove 
3. Table for further discussion  

 
Financial Considerations: Change Order #1 is for an increase of $101.43.  Funding will be from the Iron Flat’s RHID.      

 
Amount $: $101.43 

 
Fund: 46230300  442004 

 
__ Budgeted Expense __Grant __ Bonds _X_Other  RHID      

 
Legal Considerations:  By approving the Change Order from Building Solutions, LLC, Inc., the contract dollar amount will 
be amended. 
 
Mission/Values:   The completion of this project aligns with the City’s Core Value of Ongoing Improvement and Safety.   
 
Attachments:  Change Order #1 
Approved for the Agenda by: 
 

 
________________________________ 
Ray Slattery, PE, Dir. of Engineering Services  



CITY OF DODGE CITY
Change Order

CONTRACT FOR:  Iron Road Improvements (6th Ave. to 14th Ave.) PROJECT NUMBER: ST 2108

CONTRACTOR: Building Solutions REQUEST NUMBER: 1

CONTRACT AMOUNT OF

OR OVERRUN CONTRACT NEW DOLLAR

ITEM PREVIOUS ADJUSTED OR UNIT UNIT AMOUNT OF

DESCRIPTION UNIT QUANTITY QUANTITY UNDERRUN PRICE PRICE CHANGE

WATERLINE QUANTITIES
12" 45° MJ Bend Each 4 2 -2 1,125.00$            (2,250.00)$        

Fire Hydrant Adjustment Each 4 3 -1 4,000.00$            (4,000.00)$        

Rem & Repl Non-Operational FH L.S. 0 1 1 1,207.50$           1,207.50$          

STREET QUANTITIES
Concrete Pavement (8")(AE)(NRDJ) S.Y. 9039 9039 0.10 54.25$                 5.43$                 

Fly Ash Treated Base S.Y. 12666 12853 187 5.00$                   935.00$             

Gravel Driveway Pavement S.Y. 265 117 -148 7.00$                   (1,036.00)$        

30" Standard Curb & Gutter L.F. 5053 5101 48 23.50$                 1,128.00$          

Type III Barricade Each 4 0 -4 1,650.00$            (6,600.00)$        

Flared End Section (HDPE)(18") Each 1 0 -1 630.00$               (630.00)$           

Flared End Section (RCP)(30") Each 2 1 -1 1,050.00$            (1,050.00)$        

Storm Sewer Pipe (18" HDPE) L.F. 56 0 -56 40.75$                 (2,282.00)$        

Storm Sewer Pipe (30" HDPE) L.F. 58 30 -28 69.00$                 (1,932.00)$        

Storm Sewer Pipe (42" HDPE) L.F. 87 100 13 104.00$               1,352.00$          

Silt Fence L.F. 3268 3266 -2 3.25$                   (6.50)$               

Inlet Protection Each 14 12 -2 300.00$               (600.00)$           

Construction Entrance Each 2 0 -2 2,000.00$            (4,000.00)$        

Ditch Check Each 4 0 -4 600.00$               (2,400.00)$        

Storm Sewer Pipe (30" RCP) L.F. 0 28 28 79.00$                2,212.00$          

Storm Sewer Pipe (8" HDPE) L.F. 0 56 56 23.50$                1,316.00$          

Concrete Driveway (6") S.Y. 0 36 36 54.00$                1,944.00$          

Concrete Sidewalk (6") S.Y. 0 22 22 54.00$                1,188.00$          

Removal of Erosion Control L.S. 0 1 1 15,600.00$         15,600.00$       

NET INCREASE 101.43$             

RECOMMENDED FOR APPROVAL:

                                                                            

Ray Slattery, P.E.

Director of Engineering Services

Contractor: Building Solutions

                                                                               By:

Connie Marquez, City Clerk

___________________________

Mayor or City Manager

This is to affirm that I have inspected 

this change in plans and construction 
and hereby agree to the quantities, unit 
prices, and amounts shown above.



 
To: Nick Hernandez, City Manager and City Commissioners   
From: Nicole May, Finance Director   
Date: September 6, 2022   
Subject: Ordinance Nos. 3803 & 3804   
Agenda Item: Ordinances and Resolutions 
 
Purpose: To adopt the changes to basic traffic and safety laws around the State of Kansas.  
 
Recommendation: I recommend the approval of Ordinance No. 3803 & Ordinance No. 3804.   
 
Background: Ordinance No. 3803 adopts the “2023, 50th Edition of the Standard Traffic Ordinance” by 
reference. Ordinance No.  3804 adopts the “2023, 39th Edition of the Uniform Public Offense Code” by 
reference.   The changes made to these codes during the 2022 legislature are: 
 

The following sections were modified in the 50th edition of the STO published in 2023. 

Section 163. Additional Lighting Equipment 

Section 179. Spilling Loads on Highways Prohibited. 

Section 194. Driving While License Canceled, Suspended or Revoked, Penalty. 

 

The following sections were modified in the 39th edition of the UPOC published in 2023. 

Section 1.1 Definitions 

Added:  Airbag 

 Counterfeit Supplemental Restraint System Component 

 Hard Cider 

 Maliciously 

 Nonfunctional Airbag 

 Sexually Explicit Conduct 

 Supplemental Restraint System 

Amended: Temporary Permit 
      Wildlife 
      Wine 
 
 
 



Moved to Section 6.7: Health Care Facility 
            Health Care Provider 
 
Section 3.2.3.   Battery Against a Health Care Provider. 

Section 3.6.      Unlawful Restraint. 

Section 3.8.      Violation of Protection from Abuse Order. 

Section 3.13.    Stalking. 

Section 5.5.      Watercraft; Lifesaving Devices Required. 

Section 5.6.      Purchase or Possession of Cigarettes or Tobacco 
                       Products by a Minor. 
 
Section 6.7.      Criminal Trespass. 

Section 6.22.    Criminal Hunting. 

Section 6.27.    Counterfeit Airbag Violation. 

Section 7.2.      Interference with Law Enforcement. 

Section 10.5.    Unlawful Discharge of a Firearm. 

Section 10.30   Operating an Aircraft Under the Influence. 

Section 11.3.    Commercialization of Wildlife. 

Section 11.11.  Cruelty to Animals 

 
City Commission Options: 

1. Approve  
2. Disapprove 
3. Table for further discussion  

 
Financial Considerations: The cost of the booklets for the pertinent employees’ use is approximately 
$1,225.26. Cost for each booklet is $8.50. Budgeted expense through various departments. 
 
Legal Considerations:  City Attorney reviewed the booklets. He approved them. 
 
Mission/Values: Ensure the City is up to date on all the laws passed in the State of Kansas as well as make 
sure all employees have easy access to these laws. 
 
Attachments:  Ordinance No. 3803 & Ordinance No. 3804. 
 
Approved for the Agenda by: 
 

 
________________________________ 



ORDINANCE NO. 3803 

 
AN ORDINANCE REGULATING TRAFFIC WITHIN THE  

CORPORATE LIMITS OF THE CITY OF DODGE CITY, KANSAS; 
INCORPORATING BY REFERENCE THE "2023 STANDARD 

 TRAFFIC ORDINANCE FOR KANSAS CITIES" AND 
 REPEALING ORDINANCE NO. 3799  

 
     

Be it Ordained by the Governing Body of the City of Dodge City: 
 
Section 1:  INCORPORATING STANDARD TRAFFIC ORDINANCE.  There is 
hereby incorporated by Reference for the purpose of regulating traffic within the 
corporate limits of the City of Dodge City, Kansas, that certain standard traffic ordinance 
known as the "Standard Traffic Ordinance for Kansas Cities”, prepared and published in 
book form by the League of Kansas Municipalities, Topeka Kansas. One copy of said 
Standard Traffic Ordinance shall be marked or stamped "Official Copy as Adopted by 
Ordinance No. 3803"  and to which shall be attached a copy of this ordinance, and filed 
with the City Clerk to be open to inspection and available to the public at all reasonable 
hours. The police department, municipal judge and all administrative departments of the 
City charged with enforcement of the ordinance shall be supplied, at the cost of the City, 
such number of official copies of said Standard Traffic Ordinance similarly marked, as 
may be deemed expedient. 
 
Section 2:  TRAFFIC INFRACTIONS AND TRAFFIC OFFENSES. 
 

(a) An ordinance traffic infraction is a violation of any section of this ordinance that 
prescribes or requires the same behavior as that prescribed or required by a 
statutory provision that is classified as a traffic infraction in K.S.A. 8-2118. 

(b) All traffic violations which are included within this ordinance, and which are not 
ordinance traffic infractions, as defined in subsection (a) of this section shall be 
considered traffic offenses. 

   
Section 3:  REPEAL. Ordinance No. 3799 is hereby repealed. 
 
Section 4:  EFFECTIVE DATE. This ordinance shall take effect and be in force from 
and after its publication in the official City newspaper. 
 
Passed by the governing body of the City of Dodge City, Kansas, this 21st day of August, 
2023. 
                          
                           
                 
                                                                                    ___________________________ 
                                                     Mayor 
 
 
ATTEST: 
 
 
 
 
___________________________ 
City Clerk 



ORDINANCE NO.  3804 

 
AN ORDINANCE REGULATING PUBLIC OFFENSES WITHIN THE  

            CORPORATE LIMITS OF THE CITY OF DODGE CITY, KANSAS;     
                   INCORPORATING BY REFERENCE THE "2023 UNIFORM  
                      PUBLIC OFFENSE CODE FOR KANSAS CITIES” AND  
                                        REPEALING ORDINANCE NO. 3780 
      
Be it Ordained by the Governing Body of the City of Dodge City: 
 
Section 1:  INCORPORATING UNIFORM PUBLIC OFFENSE CODE.   There is 
hereby incorporated by Reference for the purpose of regulating public offenses within the 
corporate limits of the City of Dodge City, Kansas, that certain code known as the "2023 
Uniform Public Offense Code for Kansas Cities”, prepared and published in book form 
by the League of Kansas Municipalities, Topeka Kansas. One official copy of said 
Uniform Public Offense Code shall be marked or stamped "Official Copy as Adopted by 
Ordinance No. 3804"  and to which shall be attached a copy of this ordinance, and filed 
with the City Clerk to be open to inspection and available to the public at all reasonable 
hours. 
 
Section 2:  REPEAL. Ordinance No. 3780 is hereby repealed. 
 
Section 3:  EFFECTIVE DATE. This ordinance shall take effect and be in force from 
and after its publication in the official City newspaper. 
 
Passed by the governing body of the City of Dodge City, Kansas, this 21st day of August, 
2023.   
 
                          
                                            _________________________ 
                                              Mayor 
 
 
ATTEST 
 
 
 
 ________________________                    
City Clerk 

 



 



 

 

 

































 
To: Nick Hernandez, City Manager and City Commissioners   
From: Nathan Littrell, Planning & Zoning Administrator   
Date: August 21, 2023   
Subject: United Village Addition Plat   
Agenda Item: New Business 
 
Purpose:  The applicant wishes to plat this property zoned R-3 Residential Higher Density to allow for single-family 
residential development.  
 
Recommendation:  It is City Staff’s recommendation to approve this plat. On July 27, 2023, the Planning Commission 
reviewed and voted 4-0 to recommend approval of the plat. The plat does not conflict with the City’s Comprehensive 
Plan. 
 
Background:  The applicant wishes to replat this property zoned R-3 Residential Higher Density to allow for a single-
family residential development. The property was rezoned to R-3 on November 21, 2022. The western portion of the 
property had been previously platted as part of Millers Add, but had never been developed beyond the properties 
immediately fronting 14th Ave. The property is currently vacant.  
 
This plat will allow for 206 single-family residential lots. All of the proposed lots meet R-3 Residential Higher Density 
zone minimum lot requirements. The proposed streets and R.O.W. meet City requirements. The proposed development 
will have two access points off of 14th Ave. and one access point on the northeast end to McArtor Rd. The Proposed 
utilities have been reviewed by City staff and are in suitable locations. The drainage plan for this development both 
adequately addresses the development of this area and also improves some existing drainage issues of the surrounding 
area. 
 
City Commission Options: 

1. Approve  
2. Disapprove 
3. Disapprove with recommended revisions 
4. Table for further discussion  

 
Financial Considerations: None 
 
Legal Considerations: None 
 
Mission/Values: Approving this plat will encourage and support growth and development in our community. 
 
Attachments:  Plat Application, Map, Plat 
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FINAL PLAT OF:
UNITED VILLAGE ADDITION

TO THE CITY OF DODGE CITY, KANSAS

SURVEY & DRAWING BY:
KEVIN W. NOLL LS

A TO Z LAND SURVEYING
23499 SW D ROAD

JETMORE, KANSAS 67854
PHONE: (M) 620-339-6635

JOB # 22-22
PAGE 1 OF 2

DATE OF TOPOGRAPHY: MAY - NOV., 2022
DATE OF TOPO. PREPARATION: MAY - FEB., 2023
SITE CPS:
CP #1  THIS IS THE INITIAL CONTROL POINT (GPS NORTH IS FROM THIS MON.)  SET 1/2" X 24" LONG GROUND ROD WITH ORANGE A TO Z LS 1053
SURVEY CAP (6" DEEP) WNW OF CENTER OF SEC. 2 (AS SHOWN)  NORTH = 20,000.00',   EAST =  20,000.00',  ELEVATION = 2496.28' GPS (DERIVED
FROM CITY OF DODGE CITY GPS NETWORK)
CP #2   (NOT SHOWN) SET 1/2" X 24" LONG GROUND ROD WITHOUT SURVEY CAP (6" DEEP) ON ROUGHLY THE WEST R\W LINE OF 14TH AVE. 20'
SOUTH OF 2ND MH SOUTH OF WEST 1/4 CORNER OF SEC. 2    NORTH = 19,390.62',   EAST =  17,849.47',  ELEVATION = 2498.40' GPS
CP #3   (AS SHOWN) SET 1/2" X 24" LONG GROUND ROD WITH ORANGE A TO Z LS 1053  SURVEY CAP (6" DEEP) WNW OF NE COR. OF THIS
SURVEY.   NORTH = 21,539.50',   EAST =  20240.83',  ELEVATION = 2487.92' GPS
   THE ELEVATIONS FOR THIS DRAWING WERE MEASURED BY GPS.  THE TYPICAL ACCURACY FOR THESE TYPE OF MEASUREMENTS IS +/- 0.1'
TO 0.2'.
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CURVE TABLE:
CURVE   DELTA   RADIUS  TANGENT  ARC LENGTH   CHORD BEARING AND DISTANCE
A            45°00'00"    90.00'       37.28'            70.69'                S. 67°42'37" E.  68.88'
B            44°56'07"    90.00'       37.22'            70.58'                S. 67°40'41" E.  68.79'
C            45°00'00"    90.00'       37.28'            70.69'                N. 22°36'20" E.  68.88'
D            90°00'00"    90.00'       90.00'            141.37'              N. 45°06'20" E. 127.28'
E            12°42'57"    90.00'       10.03'            19.97'                N. 83°44'52" E.  19.93'
F            10°08'17"    90.00'         7.98'            15.92'                N. 82°27'32" E.  15.90'
G            32°18'39"    90.00'       26.07'            50.75'                N. 71°22'21" E.  50.08'
H            12°41'21"    90.00'       10.01'            19.93'                N. 48°52'21" E.  19.89'
I             45°00'00"    90.00'       37.28'            70.69'                N. 65°01'40" E.   68.88'
J             45°00'00"    90.00'       37.28'            70.69'                N. 22°23'40" W.  68.88'
K            90°00'00"    90.00'       90.00'            141.37'              N. 45°01'49" W.  127.28'
L            35°31'19"    90.00'       28.83'            55.81'                N. 71°56'01" E.  54.92'
M           35°47'59"    90.00'       29.07'            56.23'                N. 17°55'49" W.  55.32'
N           90°00'00"    90.00'       90.00'            141.37'              N. 44°58'11" E.  127.28'
O           36°15'40"    90.00'       29.47'            52.96'                N. 72°18'02" E.  56.01'
P            90°27'41"    90.00'       90.73'            142.10'              N. 45°12'02" E.  127.79'

TRACT A, BLOCK 8:
WILL BE DEEDED TO THE LANDOWNER OF THE PROPERTY TO THE SOUTH.



 
To:  Nick Hernandez, City Manager and City Commissioners   
From:  Ray Slattery, PE, Director of Engineering Services   
Date:  August 21, 2023   
Subject:  Approval of quotes for Infrastructure Improvements for United Village Sub-Division, PL 2204  
Agenda Item: New Business 
 
Purpose:  The installation of infrastructure in the United Village Subdivision will open approximately 208 lots 
for development. 
 
Recommendation:  Approve the quotes from Kansas Dirt, Inc. for earthwork and storm sewer installation in 
the amount of $838,129.74 and the quote from Building Solutions, LLC for the installation of sanitary sewer, 
water, paving, and RCB in the amount of $5,712,196.50.  These two quotes combined will completed the 
construction of all the necessary infrastructure for the United Village Subdivision.   
 
Background:  The City has been working with the Developer of the United Village Subdivision to develop the 
infrastructure plans for water, sewer, storm sewer, streets, and RCB to service this new development.  This 
project is part of the RHID Program.  The Developer requested quotes for the construction of the infrastructure 
from several contractors.  Kansas Dirt, Inc. and Building Solutions, LLC teamed together to provide the low 
total quote of $6,550,326.24.   
 
The developer did receive quotes from two contractors for the complete project, MJE LLC in the amount of 
$8,015,630.00 and a quote from APAC Kansas, Shears Division in the amount of $8,601,769.20, however 
APAC Shears Division, bid asphalt as the street pavement instead of concrete.  The quotes from Morgan 
Brothers Construction and Andale Construction were for pavement only. 
 
The City’s Engineer’s Estimate for the project was $7,220,617.50.  The Developer’s Estimate for the project 
was $8,304,471.00.  The quote is $670,291.26 or 9.28% below the Engineer’s Estimate and $1,754,144.76 or 
26.78% below the Consultant’s Estimate.  There are 207 Lots in the United Village development.  The cost per 
lot for infrastructure will be $31,644.09.      
 
City Commission Options: 

1. Approve Quote 
2. Disapprove 
3. Table for further discussion  

 
Financial Considerations: 

 
Amount $: 6,550,326.24 

 
Fund:   

 
__ Budgeted Expense __Grant __ Bonds _X_Other     RHID 

 



 
Legal Considerations:  The City will be entering into a contract with Kansas Dirt Inc. and Building Solutions, 
LLC and will be bound by the provisions of this contract. 
 
Mission/Values:   Approving this quote for infrastructure installation of the United Village Subdivision aligns 
with the City’s Core Values of Working Towards Excellence and Ongoing Improvement. 
 
Attachments:  Quote Tab and Propose Plat of United Village Subdivision 
 
Approved for the Agenda by:  

 
________________________________ 
Ray Slattery, Dir. Of Engineering Services  



PROJECT: UNITED VILLAGE INFRASTRUCTURE CONTRACTOR: CONTRACTOR: CONTRACTOR: CONTRACTOR: CONTRACTOR: CONTRACTOR:
Kansas Dirt, Inc. Building Solutions APAC MJE Morgan Brothers Andale

ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS
They submitted aspahlt as base bid

CITY St John CITY Dodge City CITY Dodge City CITY Montezuma CITY Lacross CITY Wichita
STATE KS STATE KS STATE KS STATE KS STATE KS STATE KS
ZIP 67576 ZIP 67801 ZIP 67801 ZIP ZIP 67548 ZIP 67219

           ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE

ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE
 CONTRACT 
AMOUNT UNIT PRICE

 CONTRACT 
AMOUNT UNIT PRICE

 CONTRACT 
AMOUNT UNIT PRICE

 CONTRACT 
AMOUNT UNIT PRICE

 CONTRACT 
AMOUNT UNIT PRICE

 CONTRACT 
AMOUNT 

General
1 Mobilization 1 L.S. 90,000.00$        90,000.00$                    65,500.00$                65,500.00$                138,800.00$              138,800.00$              885,000.00$              885,000.00$              600,000.00$              600,000.00$              140,000.00$              140,000.00$              58,295.00$                58,295.00$                
2 Erosion Control 1 L.S. 120,000.00$     120,000.00$                  No Bid No Bid 184,000.00$              184,000.00$              379,350.00$              379,350.00$              130,000.00$              130,000.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 Traffic Control 1 L.S. 15,000.00$        15,000.00$                    No Bid No Bid 9,700.00$                   9,700.00$                   38,675.00$                38,675.00$                5,000.00$                   5,000.00$                   No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 Construction Staking 1 L.S. 30,000.00$        30,000.00$                    No Bid No Bid 23,500.00$                23,500.00$                77,520.00$                77,520.00$                90,000.00$                90,000.00$                No Bid No Bid 43,700.00$                43,700.00$                

Sanitary Sewer Improvements
5 Removal of Exisitng Sanitary Sewer 1 L.S. 20,000.00$        20,000.00$                    No Bid No Bid 37,500.00$                37,500.00$                46,000.00$                46,000.00$                16,500.00$                16,500.00$                No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 Sanitary Sewer Connection 2 Each 3,500.00$          7,000.00$                      No Bid No Bid 2,400.00$                   4,800.00$                   2,225.00$                   4,450.00$                   2,300.00$                   4,600.00$                   No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 10" SDR 35 Sanitary Sewer Pipe 8079 L.F. 40.00$               323,160.00$                  No Bid No Bid 36.00$                        290,844.00$              54.50$                        440,305.50$              65.00$                        525,135.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 12" SDR 35 Sanitary Sewer Pipe 1295 L.F. 50.00$               64,750.00$                    No Bid No Bid 48.00$                        62,160.00$                70.10$                        90,779.50$                90.00$                        116,550.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 Trench & Backfill 9374 L.F. 22.00$               206,228.00$                  No Bid No Bid 10.00$                        93,740.00$                1.10$                          10,311.40$                5.50$                          51,557.00$                No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10 Standard Manhole (0-6') w/ Std. Ring & Cover 38 Each 5,500.00$          209,000.00$                  No Bid No Bid 4,500.00$                   171,000.00$              5,010.00$                   190,380.00$              5,500.00$                   209,000.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11 Manhole (Extra Depth) 63 L.F. 300.00$             18,900.00$                    No Bid No Bid 400.00$                      25,200.00$                615.00$                      38,745.00$                110.00$                      6,930.00$                   No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 Service Wye (with Connection) 208 Each 600.00$             124,800.00$                  No Bid No Bid 250.00$                      52,000.00$                555.00$                      115,440.00$              800.00$                      166,400.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
13 4" Schedule 40 Service Line (includes fittings) 8967 L.F. 40.00$               358,680.00$                  No Bid No Bid 25.00$                        224,175.00$              32.25$                        289,185.75$              38.00$                        340,746.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 Encase Sewerline 220 L.F. 60.00$               13,200.00$                    No Bid No Bid 55.00$                        12,100.00$                155.80$                      34,276.00$                70.00$                        15,400.00$                No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
15 Encase Sewer Service Line 2178 L.F. 50.00$               108,900.00$                  No Bid No Bid 55.00$                        119,790.00$              155.80$                      339,332.40$              60.00$                        130,680.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Waterline Improvements
16 Removal of Exisitng Waterline 1 L.S. 10,000.00$        10,000.00$                    No Bid No Bid 45,000.00$                45,000.00$                44,000.00$                44,000.00$                27,500.00$                27,500.00$                No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
17 Waterline Connection 3 Each 2,500.00$          7,500.00$                      No Bid No Bid 3,000.00$                   9,000.00$                   8,500.00$                   25,500.00$                9,000.00$                   27,000.00$                No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
18 6" PVC Pipe (C900) 128 L.F. 40.00$               5,120.00$                      No Bid No Bid 96.00$                        12,288.00$                31.15$                        3,987.20$                   52.00$                        6,656.00$                   No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
19 8" PVC Pipe (C900) 8427 L.F. 45.00$               379,215.00$                  No Bid No Bid 50.00$                        421,350.00$              46.75$                        393,962.25$              60.00$                        505,620.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
20 12" PVC Pipe (C900) 3215 L.F. 55.00$               176,825.00$                  No Bid No Bid 100.00$                      321,500.00$              92.35$                        296,905.25$              100.00$                      321,500.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
21 6" Gate Valve w/ Valve Box 24 Each 2,000.00$          48,000.00$                    No Bid No Bid 2,000.00$                   48,000.00$                1,400.00$                   33,600.00$                1,950.00$                   46,800.00$                No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
22 8" Gate Valve w/ Valve Box 19 Each 3,500.00$          66,500.00$                    No Bid No Bid 3,000.00$                   57,000.00$                2,115.00$                   40,185.00$                3,000.00$                   57,000.00$                No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
23 12" Gate Valve w/ Valve Box 8 Each 4,500.00$          36,000.00$                    No Bid No Bid 5,500.00$                   44,000.00$                4,450.00$                   35,600.00$                6,000.00$                   48,000.00$                No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
24 Fire Hydrant Assembly (3-way) 24 Each 4,500.00$          108,000.00$                  No Bid No Bid 6,000.00$                   144,000.00$              5,010.00$                   120,240.00$              6,500.00$                   156,000.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
25 Monitoring Station for Tracer Wire 24 Each 500.00$             12,000.00$                    No Bid No Bid 250.00$                      6,000.00$                   167.00$                      4,008.00$                   350.00$                      8,400.00$                   No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
26 1" Service Connection (incl. Saddle, Corp. Stop & Fittings) 207 Each 1,400.00$          289,800.00$                  No Bid No Bid 1,000.00$                   207,000.00$              860.00$                      178,020.00$              900.00$                      186,300.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
27 1" Polyethylene Tubing 5343 L.F. 20.00$               106,860.00$                  No Bid No Bid 6.00$                          32,058.00$                11.15$                        59,574.45$                16.50$                        88,159.50$                No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
28 Encase Water Service Line 770 L.F. 20.00$               15,400.00$                    No Bid No Bid 6.00$                          4,620.00$                   5.60$                          4,312.00$                   48.00$                        36,960.00$                No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Street & Drainage Improvements
29 Common Excavation 39297 C.Y. 15.00$               589,455.00$                  6.50$                          255,430.50$              No Bid No Bid 4.45$                          174,871.65$              4.20$                          165,047.40$              6.50$                          255,430.50$              2.98$                          117,105.06$              
30 Compacted Embankment (In Place) (STREETS ONLY) 58122 C.Y. 10.00$               581,220.00$                  4.50$                          261,549.00$              No Bid No Bid 4.45$                          258,642.90$              6.80$                          395,229.60$              4.50$                          261,549.00$              7.36$                          427,777.92$              
31 Rock Excavation 9 C.Y. 100.00$             900.00$                          167.00$                      1,503.00$                   No Bid No Bid 167.00$                      1,503.00$                   65.00$                        585.00$                      167.00$                      1,503.00$                   63.34$                        570.06$                      
32 Fly Ash 1937 Tons 100.00$             193,700.00$                  27.20$                        52,686.40$                No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 20.00$                        38,740.00$                27.20$                        52,686.40$                26.04$                        50,439.48$                
33 Manipulation of Fly Ash Subgrade 43033 S.Y. 10.00$               430,330.00$                  3.16$                          135,984.28$              No Bid No Bid 8.35$                          359,325.55$              6.00$                          258,198.00$              1.72$                          74,016.76$                3.07$                          132,111.31$              
34 Geogrid (removed, due to concrete pavement) 43033 S.Y. -$                    -$                                Removed Removed Removed Removed 5.10$                          219,468.30$              Removed Removed Removed Removed Removed Removed
35 Curb & Gutter, Combined (AE) 21678 L.F. 36.00$               780,408.00$                  No Bid No Bid 24.50$                        531,111.00$              25.65$                        556,040.70$              24.00$                        520,272.00$              25.00$                        541,950.00$              15.67$                        339,694.26$              
36 Concrete Pavement (6") (NRDJ) 36300 S.Y. 75.00$               2,722,500.00$               No Bid No Bid 48.75$                        1,769,625.00$           No Bid No Bid 52.00$                        1,887,600.00$           51.13$                        1,856,019.00$           60.88$                        2,209,944.00$           
37 Concrete Pavement (7") 706 S.Y. 90.00$               63,540.00$                    No Bid No Bid 53.75$                        37,947.50$                134.65$                      95,062.90$                72.00$                        50,832.00$                51.58$                        36,415.48$                62.96$                        44,449.76$                
38 Concrete Flume 5 Each 3,000.00$          15,000.00$                    No Bid No Bid 6,350.00$                   31,750.00$                8,250.00$                   41,250.00$                5,000.00$                   25,000.00$                5,400.00$                   27,000.00$                3,530.31$                   17,651.55$                
39 Flexamat Slope Protection 286 S.Y. 140.00$             40,040.00$                    70.20$                        20,077.20$                No Bid No Bid 60.00$                        17,160.00$                115.00$                      32,890.00$                279.72$                      79,999.92$                No Bid No Bid
40 Concrete (Grade 4.0)(AE) 320 C.Y. 1,100.00$          352,000.00$                  No Bid No Bid 742.50$                      237,600.00$              1,208.00$                   386,560.00$              825.00$                      264,000.00$              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
41 Reinforcing Steel (Grade 60) 3420 Lbs. 4.00$                  13,680.00$                    No Bid No Bid 2.00$                          6,840.00$                   2.25$                          7,695.00$                   2.25$                          7,695.00$                   No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
42 Reinforcing Steel (Grade 60)(Epoxy Coated) 79570 Lbs. 5.00$                  397,850.00$                  No Bid No Bid 2.50$                          198,925.00$              4.45$                          354,086.50$              2.75$                          218,817.50$              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
43 RCB Handrail 1 L.S. 20,000.00$        20,000.00$                    No Bid No Bid 19,698.00$                19,698.00$                28,380.00$                28,380.00$                19,500.00$                19,500.00$                No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
44 Curb Inlet 6 Each 10,000.00$        60,000.00$                    No Bid No Bid 7,950.00$                   47,700.00$                7,900.00$                   47,400.00$                9,000.00$                   54,000.00$                No Bid No Bid 473.42$                      2,840.52$                   
45 Special Inlet 1 Each 10,000.00$        10,000.00$                    No Bid No Bid 8,775.00$                   8,775.00$                   8,800.00$                   8,800.00$                   10,000.00$                10,000.00$                No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
46 Reinforced Conrete Manhole 1 Each 10,000.00$        10,000.00$                    No Bid No Bid 7,300.00$                   7,300.00$                   6,790.00$                   6,790.00$                   6,750.00$                   6,750.00$                   No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
47 Storm Sewer Pipe (18")(RCP) 72 L.F. 80.00$               5,760.00$                      126.38$                      9,099.36$                   No Bid No Bid 71.25$                        5,130.00$                   90.00$                        6,480.00$                   126.38$                      9,099.36$                   No Bid No Bid
48 Storm Sewer Pipe (36")(RCP) 250 L.F. 100.00$             25,000.00$                    60.84$                        15,210.00$                No Bid No Bid 148.00$                      37,000.00$                170.00$                      42,500.00$                60.84$                        15,210.00$                No Bid No Bid
49 Storm Sewer Pipe (24"x38")(RCPHE) 370 L.F. 120.00$             44,400.00$                    57.00$                        21,090.00$                No Bid No Bid 170.00$                      62,900.00$                190.00$                      70,300.00$                57.00$                        21,090.00$                No Bid No Bid
50 Seeding 6 Acres 2,000.00$          12,000.00$                    No Bid No Bid 2,300.00$                   13,800.00$                2,735.00$                   16,410.00$                2,800.00$                   16,800.00$                No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Total Construction Cost 9,338,621.00$              838,129.74$              5,712,196.50$          6,904,121.20$          8,015,630.00$          3,371,969.42$          3,444,578.92$           

Bidder's Specific Added Items
Site Cleaning 1 L.S. MISC 356,000.00$              56,000.00$                56,000.00$                MISC 825,000.00$              MISC 140,000.00$              MISC 101,995.00$              
SWPPP Inspections 52 Each Utilities 2,445,125.00$           575.00$                      29,900.00$                Utilities 3,099,393.50$           Utilities -$                            Utilities -$                            
Testing 1 L.S. Grading & Paving 3,749,201.24$           46,000.00$                46,000.00$                Grading & Paving 4,091,236.50$           Grading & Paving 3,231,969.42$           Grading & Paving 3,342,583.92$           
Add Alt -- 6" Asphalt Pavement 36300 S.Y. TOTAL 6,550,326.24$       42.50$                        1,542,750.00$           TOTAL 8,015,630.00$       TOTAL 3,371,969.42$       TOTAL 3,444,578.92$       
Payment and Performance Bond 1 L.S. 22,998.00$                22,998.00$                

RCB 463,063.00$              8,601,769.20$          
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DATE OF TOPOGRAPHY: MAY - NOV., 2022
DATE OF TOPO. PREPARATION: MAY - FEB., 2023
SITE CPS:
CP #1  THIS IS THE INITIAL CONTROL POINT (GPS NORTH IS FROM THIS MON.)  SET 1/2" X 24" LONG GROUND ROD WITH ORANGE A TO Z LS 1053
SURVEY CAP (6" DEEP) WNW OF CENTER OF SEC. 2 (AS SHOWN)  NORTH = 20,000.00',   EAST =  20,000.00',  ELEVATION = 2496.28' GPS (DERIVED
FROM CITY OF DODGE CITY GPS NETWORK)
CP #2   (NOT SHOWN) SET 1/2" X 24" LONG GROUND ROD WITHOUT SURVEY CAP (6" DEEP) ON ROUGHLY THE WEST R\W LINE OF 14TH AVE. 20'
SOUTH OF 2ND MH SOUTH OF WEST 1/4 CORNER OF SEC. 2    NORTH = 19,390.62',   EAST =  17,849.47',  ELEVATION = 2498.40' GPS
CP #3   (AS SHOWN) SET 1/2" X 24" LONG GROUND ROD WITH ORANGE A TO Z LS 1053  SURVEY CAP (6" DEEP) WNW OF NE COR. OF THIS
SURVEY.   NORTH = 21,539.50',   EAST =  20240.83',  ELEVATION = 2487.92' GPS
   THE ELEVATIONS FOR THIS DRAWING WERE MEASURED BY GPS.  THE TYPICAL ACCURACY FOR THESE TYPE OF MEASUREMENTS IS +/- 0.1'
TO 0.2'.
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A TO Z 3/4" I.D. PIPE AT 1997 STATUTE
CENTER CORNER OF SECTION 2 WAS
TORE OUT IN 2002 AND THERE IS NOW
A 1/2" REBAR O.U. NEAR IT'S PLACE
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FOUND 3/4' I.D. PIPE IN COUNTY 6" MON. BOX.   WHICH IS IN THE SAME
LOCATION AS WHERE THE STONE WAS AT THE NORTH 1/4 CORNER OF
SECTION 2, T. 27 S., R. 25 W. OF 6TH P.M. FORD COUNTY, KANSAS.
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FOUND COUNTY 6" MON. BOX. OVER RECORD CORNER (LID WILL NOT OPEN)
AT THE CURRENTLY RECOGNIZED NW CORNER OF SECTION 2, T. 27 S., R. 25
W. OF 6TH P.M. FORD COUNTY, KANSAS.
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SURVEY CONTROL POINT (CP)
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S. 00°44'29" W.
N. 62°16'50" E.
S. 89°34'08" E.
S. 00°30'43" W.
S. 89°34'08" E.
N. 00°30'43" E.
S. 89°34'08" E.
N. 00°30'43" E.
S. 89°34'35" E.
S. 00°01'49" E.

LINE
I - II

II - III
III - IV
IV - V
V - VI

VI - VII
VII - VIII
VIII - IX
IX - X
X - XI
XI -XII

XII - XIII
XIII - XIV
XIV - XV
XV XVI

XVI - XVII
XVII - XVIII
XVIII - XIX
XIX - XX
XX - XXI

XXI - XXII
XXII - XXIII
XXIII - XXIV
XXIV - XXV

XXV- I

E-W SIN.
0.000528
0.999965
0.001896
0.999069
0.001537

   0.999069
0.001842
0.999993
0.001537
0.999973
0.956462
0.016352
0.999997
0.651826
0.999972
0.012939
0.885236
0.999972
0.008935
0.999972
0.008935
0.999972
0.008935
0.999973
0.000528

N-S COS.
1.000000
0.008373
0.999998
0.043135
0.999999
0.043135
0.999998
0.003670
0.999999
0.007393
0.291857
0.999866
0.002540
0.758368
0.007524
0.999916
0.465142
0.007524
0.999960
0.007524
0.999960
0.007524
0.999960
0.007393
1.000000

CLOSURE BLOCK
WEST

1653.862'
0.057'

988.909'

179.009'

0.163'

0.013'

1.144'

2823.157'

EAST
0.841'

0.092'
178.733'

1.690'

0.160'
989.203'
168.433'

594.438'
141.753'

22.999'

259.179'
93.297'

149.996'
1.144'

165.495'
3.138'

52.539'
0.011'

2823.141'

SOUTH
1590.700'

29.880'
42.696'

0.657'

7.314'
51.396'

9.949'

0.173'
1.000'

0.702'
127.995'

1.129'

1.245'

0.388'
19.960'
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CURVE TABLE:
CURVE   DELTA   RADIUS  TANGENT  ARC LENGTH   CHORD BEARING AND DISTANCE
A            45°00'00"    90.00'       37.28'            70.69'                S. 67°42'37" E.  68.88'
B            44°56'07"    90.00'       37.22'            70.58'                S. 67°40'41" E.  68.79'
C            45°00'00"    90.00'       37.28'            70.69'                N. 22°36'20" E.  68.88'
D            90°00'00"    90.00'       90.00'            141.37'              N. 45°06'20" E. 127.28'
E            12°42'57"    90.00'       10.03'            19.97'                N. 83°44'52" E.  19.93'
F            10°08'17"    90.00'         7.98'            15.92'                N. 82°27'32" E.  15.90'
G            32°18'39"    90.00'       26.07'            50.75'                N. 71°22'21" E.  50.08'
H            12°41'21"    90.00'       10.01'            19.93'                N. 48°52'21" E.  19.89'
I             45°00'00"    90.00'       37.28'            70.69'                N. 65°01'40" E.   68.88'
J             45°00'00"    90.00'       37.28'            70.69'                N. 22°23'40" W.  68.88'
K            90°00'00"    90.00'       90.00'            141.37'              N. 45°01'49" W.  127.28'
L            35°31'19"    90.00'       28.83'            55.81'                N. 71°56'01" E.  54.92'
M           35°47'59"    90.00'       29.07'            56.23'                N. 17°55'49" W.  55.32'
N           90°00'00"    90.00'       90.00'            141.37'              N. 44°58'11" E.  127.28'
O           36°15'40"    90.00'       29.47'            52.96'                N. 72°18'02" E.  56.01'
P            90°27'41"    90.00'       90.73'            142.10'              N. 45°12'02" E.  127.79'

TRACT A, BLOCK 8:
WILL BE DEEDED TO THE LANDOWNER OF THE PROPERTY TO THE SOUTH.



 
To:  Nick Hernandez, City Manager and City Commissioners   
From:  Ray Slattery, PE, Director of Engineering    
Date:  August 21, 2023 
Subject:  Legends Parking Lot Repairs, PK 2202 
Agenda Item: New Business 
 
Purpose:  The purpose of this project is to repair the main driving aisle of the parking lot that is deteriorating 
due to the grade and setting water.  The replacement pavement will be concrete for these reasons and the 
amount of traffic the main driving aisle sees.  In the future all the main drive will be converted to concrete.  
 
Recommendation:  Staff would recommend approving the bid from DTD Construction, Inc. in the amount of 
$66,920.55, since they can start as soon as contracts are returned and have the project completed this year.  
The bid from DTD Construction Inc. is $1,779.80 higher than the low bid from Building Solutions, LLC of 
$65,140.75.   
 
Background:  The main drive pavement in the Legends Parking Lot has deteriorated over time and is need of 
replacement.  The pavement has development potholes and raveling of the surface material.  Some of this can 
be contributed to the age as the parking lot is close to 24 years old.  Also, this section of the parking lot flattens 
out and tends to hold water.  This is the reason for replacing the pavement with concrete pavement.   
 
Bids were opened at 2:00pm on August 16, 2023.  Three bids were received and opened.  The low bid from 
Building Solutions, LLC, one from DTD Construction, Inc., and from South Central Sealing, Inc. in the amount 
of $138,684.65.  The engineer’s estimate was $72,873.50.  Building Solutions, LLC’s tentative start date is 
February 12, 2024.  The project is to be completed by March 15,2024.        
 
City Commission Options: 

1. Approve Bid 
2. Disapprove Bid 
3. Table for further discussion  

 
Financial Considerations: 

 
Amount $: $65,140.75 

 
Fund:  11252710  441010 

 
_X_ Budgeted Expense __Grant _ _ Bonds _X_Other – WND Sales Tax      

 
 
Legal Considerations:  By approving this bid from DTD Construction, Inc. the City will enter into a contract 
with DTD Construction, Inc. and be responsible to make payments the DTD Construction, Inc. for the 
completed work. 
 



Mission/Values:   Approving this agreement aligns with the City’s Core Values of Working Towards 
Excellence and Ongoing Improvement. 
 
Attachments:  Bid Tab 
 
Approved for the Agenda by:  

 
________________________________ 
Ray Slattery, Dir. Of Engineering Services  



CITY OF DODGE CITY

BID TAB

Legend's Park Parking Lot Repairs

PK 2202

BID DATE: 8/16/2023 Dodge City Dodge City Wichita

Kansas Kansas Kansas

67801 67801 67213

 

UNIT  UNIT CONTRACT UNIT CONTRACT UNIT CONTRACT
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY PRICE AMOUNT  PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT

1 Mobilization L.S. 1 $3,200.00 3,200.00$              $3,150.00 3,150.00$             $1,500.00 1,500.00$                        $3,250.00 3,250.00$              

2 Construction Staking L.S. 1 $1,200.00 1,200.00$              $1,225.00 1,225.00$             $1,500.00 1,500.00$                        $1,750.00 1,750.00$              

3 Asphalt Excavation S.Y. 717 $11.00 7,887.00$              $15.00 10,755.00$           $6.00 4,302.00$                        $38.34 27,489.78$            

4 6" Asphalt Milling Sub-Grade S.Y. 717 $12.00 8,604.00$              $7.00 5,019.00$             $6.60 4,732.20$                        $19.08 13,680.36$            

5 Concrete Pavement (7")(AE)(NRDJ) S.Y. 717 $72.50 51,982.50$            $62.75 44,991.75$           $76.55 54,886.35$                      $129.03 92,514.51$            

6

72,873.50$         65,140.75$       66,920.55$                 138,684.65$       

BID SECURITY 5% Bond BID SECURITY 5% Check BID SECURITY 5% Bond

START DATE 2/12/2024 START DATE Signing of Contracts START DATE 9/18/2023

South Central Sealing, Inc.

3600 W. Esthner

TOTAL

Building Solutions, LLC

1106 Saddle Rd.

DTD Construction, Inc.

1901 W. Comanche St.PROJECT #: 

CONTRACTOR:

ADDRESS:

CITY:

STATE:

ZIP:

PROJECT:            

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE

CONTRACTOR:

ADDRESS:

CITY:

STATE:

ZIP:

CONTRACTOR:

ADDRESS:

CITY:

STATE:

ZIP:

TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
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